
Bid Tabulation
ITB 33-20 Housing Rehabilitation Services
Regina Johnson, Principal Buyer
johnsonre@jccal.org

PROJECT ACOFF CONSTRUCTION DWR CONSTRUCTION S & W CONSTRUCTION UNCH

GRAND TOTAL 36,320.00$                                     6,900.00$                                       44,575.00$                                 88,955.00$                                 
Ms. Rhonda Bean
1268 Lewis Street
Brighton, AL 35020
205-425-9442
Case #: 20-BR-2 19,500.00$                                      6,900.00$                                        9,900.00$                                    17,900.00$                                  

Bernice Baynes
121 Woods Ave.
Adamsville, Al. 35005
205-674-1255
Case # 20-3-1 NO BID NO BID NO BID 34,855.00$                                  

Winnie Davis
1310 Merritt Street
Bessemer, AL 35020 
205-260-4261
Case: 20-9-3 7,100.00$                                        NO BID 21,000.00$                                  19,350.00$                                  
Loretta Peevy
645 Maple Street
Fairfield, Al. 35064 
205- 593-6358
Case: 20-7-1 9,720.00$                                        NO BID 13,675.00$                                  16,850.00$                                  
Natasha Godwin
4424 Campbell Lane
Birmingham, Al. 35207
205-720-4683
Case # 19-4-1 NO BID 5,800.00$                                        18,700.00$                                  19,980.00$                                  
Emma Prewitt
2064 Lane Ave.
Tarrant, Al. 35217
205-585-0925
Case # 20-PE-4 NO BID 7,000.00$                                        NO BID 37,500.00$                                  
Helen Silmon
82 7th Street NE
Graysville, Al. 35073
205-847-8721 
Case # 19-11-3 37,400.00$                                      NO BID NO BID 20,100.00$                                  
Kimberly Yarbrough
2501 Gate Post Circle
Birmingham, Al. 35214
205-249-5169
Case # 19-13-1 30,680.00$                                      8,500.00$                                        26,250.00$                                  24,540.00$                                  

Notice of Intent to Respond YES YES YES NO
Debarment Statement YES YES YES YES
Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES NO - Not Notarized YES
Equal Employment Opportunity Cert. Form YES YES YES YES
Affidavit of Contractor YES YES NO - Not Notarized YES
Signature Sheet YES YES YES YES
Contractors Cert. Regarding Debartment, etc. YES YES YES YES
Price Sheets YES YES YES YES

ACOFF CONSTRUCTION CO., INC. 
DWR CONSTRUCTION
S & W CONSTRUCTION, LLC
UNCH, INC. 524 4th Avenue N., | Birmingham, AL 35204 | Michael Raby  P: 205.581.1688  E: unch524@gmail.com

REQUIRED FORMS 

CONTACT INFORMATION
1924 17th St. N., Bessemer, AL 35020 | Roosevelt Acoff, Sr.   P: 205.965.8622  E: acoffconstruction@gmail.com 

150 Tyler Rd., Remlap, AL 35133 | Shane Shirley   P: 205.568.0879  E: shanedshirley4@gmail.com
1020 Springview St., Birmingham, AL 35215 | William J. Donner  P: 404.663.7825  E: williamdnnr709@gmail.com 
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